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23-3-101. Chapter definitions.     
 
 

   As used in this chapter, unless the context otherwise requires:   
 

 

 

 

 

 

     (1)  “Law business” means the advising or counseling for valuable consideration of any 
person as to any secular law, the drawing or the procuring of or assisting in the drawing for 
valuable consideration of any paper, document or instrument affecting or relating to secular 
rights, the doing of any act for valuable consideration in a representative capacity, obtaining or 
tending to secure for any person any property or property rights whatsoever, or the soliciting of 
clients directly or indirectly to provide such services; 

 

 
 

 

 

 
 

 

     (2)  “Person” means a natural person, individual, governmental agency, partnership, 
corporation, trust, estate, incorporated or unincorporated association, and any other legal or 
commercial entity however organized; and  

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

     (3)  “Practice of law” means the appearance as an advocate in a representative capacity or the 
drawing of papers, pleadings or documents or the performance of any act in such capacity in 
connection with proceedings pending or prospective before any court, commissioner, referee or 
any body, board, committee or commission constituted by law or having authority to settle 
controversies, or the soliciting of clients directly or indirectly to provide such services. 

 

 

23-3-102. Public officers prohibited from practicing.      

 

 

  

Judges and chancellors are prohibited from practicing law in any of the courts of this state. The 
clerks of the several courts and their deputies are also prohibited from practicing in their own 
courts, or in any causes commenced, brought to or carried from their courts, or commenced in 
any court from which an appeal lies to their court. Sheriffs and other executive officers shall not 
practice law in the county for which they were elected, or in any cause, originating or pending in 
the courts of that county. With the exception of judges, chancellors and justices, nothing in this 
section or any other law shall be construed to prohibit employees of the executive and judicial 
branches of the government of this state who are licensed to practice law in this state from 
voluntarily providing pro bono legal services through an organized program of pro bono legal 
services that receives funding pursuant to § 16-3-808 and that provides professional liability 
insurance for losses sustained by clients of lawyers participating in the program. 

 

 

23-3-103. Unlawful practice prohibited — Penalty.      

 

 

  

(a)  No person shall engage in the practice of law or do law business, or both, as defined in § 23-
3-101, unless the person has been duly licensed and while the person's license is in full force and 
effect, nor shall any association or corporation engage in the practice of the law or do law 
business, or both. However, nonresident attorneys associated with attorneys in this state in any 
case pending in this state who do not practice regularly in this state shall be allowed, as a matter 
of courtesy, to appear in the case in which they may be thus employed without procuring a 
license, if properly authorized in accordance with applicable rules of court, and when introduced 
to the court by a member in good standing of the Tennessee bar, if all the courts of the resident 
state of the nonresident attorney grant a similar courtesy to attorneys licensed in this state. 

 

 
 

 
 

   (b)  Any person who violates the prohibition in subsection (a) commits a Class A misdemeanor.   
 

 

 

 

 

 

(c)  (1)  The attorney general and reporter may bring an action in the name of the state to restrain 
by temporary restraining order, temporary injunction or permanent injunction any violation of 
this chapter; to obtain a civil penalty in an amount not to exceed ten thousand dollars ($10,000) 
per violation, and to obtain restitution for any person who has suffered an ascertainable loss by 
reason of the violation of this chapter. The attorney general and reporter shall be entitled to be 
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reimbursed for the reasonable costs and expenses of investigation and prosecution of acts under 
this chapter, including, but not limited to, reasonable attorney fees as well as expert and other 
witness fees. 
 
 

 
 

        (2)  The action may be brought in a court of competent jurisdiction:   
 

 
 

             (A)  In the county where the alleged violation took place or is about to take place;   
 

 
 

 
 
 
          (B)  In the county in which the defendant resides, has a principal place of business or 
conducts, transacts or has conducted business; or  
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
          (C)  If the defendant cannot be found in any of the locations in subdivisions (c)(2)(A) and 
(B), in the county in which the defendant can be found.  
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
     (3)  The courts are authorized to issue orders and injunctions to restrain, prevent and remedy 
violations of this chapter, and the orders and injunctions shall be issued without bond.  
 
 

 

 

 
 

 

     (4)  Any knowing violation of the terms of an injunction or order issued pursuant to this 
chapter shall be punishable by a civil penalty of not more than twenty thousand dollars ($20,000) 
per violation, in addition to any other appropriate relief.  

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

(d)  (1)  Any organized bar association of a municipality, county, except any county having a 
metropolitan form of government, or multi-county region in which a violation occurs may bring 
a civil action seeking relief, as provided in this chapter, against any person that violates this 
chapter. Any organized statewide bar association, primarily representing plaintiff attorneys and 
having no locally-based affiliate associations, may bring a civil action in the municipality or 
county in which a violation occurs seeking relief, as provided in this chapter, against any person 
that violates this chapter. Upon the commencement of any action brought under this section by 
any bar association, the bar association shall provide a copy of the complaint or other initial 
pleading to the attorney general and reporter, who, in the public interest, may intervene and 
prosecute the action. The pleadings shall be provided to the attorney general and reporter 
simultaneously with the initial service to the defendant or defendants. Additionally, all 
subsequent filings shall be provided to the attorney general and reporter, including any 
judgments or notices of appeal by the initiating bar association. 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

     (2)  Any bar association bringing suit under this section is presumed to be acting in good faith 
and is granted a qualified immunity for the suit and the consequences of the suit. The 
presumption of good faith is rebuttable upon a showing by a preponderance of the evidence that 
the suit was brought for a malicious purpose. 

 

 

23-3-104. Unlawful division of fees — Penalties.      

 

 
  

(a)  Except as provided in the Tennessee rules of professional conduct, it is unlawful for any 
licensed attorney in the state to divide any fees or compensation received in the practice of law 
or in doing law business with any person not a licensed attorney.  

 
 

 
 

   (b)  A violation of this section is a Class C misdemeanor.   
 

 

 
 

   23-3-108. Falsely representing self as a lawyer.      
 
 

  
(a)  It is unlawful for any person, either directly or indirectly, falsely to advertise the person as, 
or hold the person out as, a lawyer.  
 
 

 
 

   (b)  A violation of this section is a Class E felony.   
 

 


